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DEFENSIVE Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

0Blight Immunity 1958 1Y Y

Having been brought to the edge of death by a Blight Demon and survived (in however convoluted a fashion), you
have begun to develop a resistance to the contagion of that particular demon.

1 Fini

15700Ring Of A Dead Deity, 1xpd 2621 1Y Y

When used by the bonded owner, this item acts like a +2 Ring of Protection.1

In addition, it will allow the user to cast a 14 point Wrath as per the CL 7 spell, once per day.2 Fini

168Bird of Sense I 2713 1Y N

When invoked, this Bird will allow the user to perform a Sense I as per the MK 4 ability, once time only.1 Fini

13250Arachnadrake Scale (Elephant Hide, 1xpd) 2759 1Y Y

When worn by the bonded owner, allows the owner to cast Elep[hant Hide as per the DR 5 spell, once per day.1 Fini

14000Evade, 1xpd 2774 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to perform an Evade as per the MKM 7 ability, once
per day.

1 Fini

500+0 Chainmail 2792 1Y Y

When worn by the bonded owner, this is +1 magic Chainmail.1 Fini

12480Runes of Awareness, 1xpd 2849 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item will allow the user to perform a Sense I as per the MK 4 abilty, once
per day.

1

In addition,  this item will allow the user to perform a Sense II as per the MK 6 abilty, once per day.2 Fini

12700Life Support, 1xpd 3208 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to peform Life Support as per the MK 7 ability, once
per day.

1 Fini

14000Evade, 1 xpd 3215 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to peform an Evade as per the MK 7 ability, once per
day.

1 Fini

13020Familiar - Basic 430 1Y Y

When purchased, the bonded owner may choose the type of Familiar. The familiar will have 5 life points to
unconsciousness, and 10 life points to death.

1

The familiar will be able to cast Awaken as per the MU 2 spell, once per day.2

In addition, this familiar can also perform a Sacrifice Throw as per the MK 3 ability, once per day.3 Fini

13100Gecko, 1xpd 3429 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item will allow the user to cast Plant Seek: Duckback as per the DR 5
spell, once per day.

1

In addition, this item is a basic Familiar, which can be developed over time.2

The bonded owner can also cast Gods/Goddesses Boon as per the CL 2 spell cast at level 2, once per day.3 Fini

12600The Life of a Friend: Resist Death, 10 pts, 1xpd 3603 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to perform a Resist Death, 10 points as per the KN 7
ability performed at level 10, once per day.

1 Fini

HEALING Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

13948Arry's Spider Offspring Familiar 3053 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this spider is a Familiar that can cast 10 points of Healing, once per day.1

In addition, it can cast a Freeze Poiton OR a Freeze Disease as per the CL 2 spells, once per day.2 Fini

12402 Points of Healing, 1xpd 3185 4Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item provides 2 points of Healing as per the CL 1 spell, once per day.1 Fini
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1796Aspects of Life 411 1Y N

This item will cast an autoactivate Life Spark as per the CL 6 spell on the bonded owner when their life points reach
0, one time only.

1

Five seconds later it will cast an autoactivated HEAL 8 points on the bonded owner  as per the CL 1 spell cast at
level 4.

2 Fini

MISC Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

0Draconic Curse 2623 1Y Y

This is a 12th level curse that makes the victim detect as half draconic. It does not allow them to speak draconic nor
does it give them any draconic abilities or traits.

1 Fini

1000Familiar Container/Blank Template 2760 1Y Y

???1

1500Butterfly #15, 1xpd 3102 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this Butterfly will allow the user to cast Message as per the MU 2 spell, once
per day.

1 Fini

160Sponge 3255 1Y N

When invoked, this item allows the user to cast Plant Seek - Sponge as per the DR 5 spell, one time only.1 Fini

50Spirit World Totem - Horse 3276 1Y Y

The user has bonded to their Animal Spirit, the Horse, and may call upon them once per day.1 Fini

12850Time Dilation: Speed. 1xpd 3600 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to perform Speed as per the MMK 7 ability, once per
day.

1 Fini

130Self Moving Rope 425 1Y Y

When used by the bonded owner, this is a 120 foor length of magical self moving rope.1

This rope is unbreakable and cannot be cut by any person other than the bonded owner.2

Should the bonded owner cut the rope, it can be repaired back to its original condition with a Mend spell.3

All aspects and restrictions of a self-moving item apply.4 Fini

12850Time Dilation: Speed. 1xpd 3600 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to perform Speed as per the MMK 7 ability, once per
day.

1 Fini

OFFENSIVE Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

1630Sandstone of Hone Arrow +2 1560 1Y Y

When wielded by the bonded owner, allows the user to perform a Hone Arrows +2 as per the RN ability, once per
day.

1 Fini

2000Bracer of Ever Changing Elements 1892 1Y Y

This bracer allows the bonded owner to wield elemental forces through ONE weapon at a time. The base element
for this item is NONE.

1

This bracer embodies the ability to switch elements (fire or ice or lightning or earth or no element) unlimited uses
per day. Five seconds must pass between switching elements.

2 Fini

10Gravity Gun with NO magic core 2622 1Y Y

This is a Gravity Gun without it's central magical core unit. It comes from a tech universrse and has no SAS at this
time.

1 Fini

500Pumpkin Leaf of Ranger Radness 2740 1Y N

When invoked, this Pumpkin Leaf allows the user to perform a Make Arrows as per the RN  ability, 7 times total.1

In addition, the user can also perfrom a Penetrating Arrow as per the RN 2 ability, one time only.2

In addition, the user can also perfrom a Target Arrow as per the RN 3 ability, one time only.3

In addition, the user can also perfrom a Long Arrow as per the RN 5 ability, one time only.4 Fini
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3600Death's Touch, +2 Weapon 2848 1Y Y

When wielded by the bonded owner, this is a +2 Weapon. Note that the "+" damage was provided by Death itself.1 Fini

11960Juvenile Fairy Dragon, 1xpd 3047 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this juvenile Dragon will cast a 2 Point Flare per the DR 2 spell, once per day.1

User must choose Earth or Fire or Ice or Lightning, and the Flare will remain that one element.2

The Flare can be raised to a total of 20 points at a cost of 100 per point.3

In addition, this dragon can cast Insect Bane as per the DR 3 spell, once per day.4 Fini

16380Stygian Quiver, 1xpd 439 1Y Y

This quiver has a small amount of water from the River Styx that builds up in it mysteriously. When used by the
bonded owner, this quiver allows the user to fire a +28 Point Blessed Arrow as per the CL 7 spell, once per day.

1 Fini

1500Alchemical Edge g 458 1Y Y

This small jewel may be inserted into a single melee weapon as soon as it is purchased. It can not be removed
afterward. After the jewel has been placed, the material of the weapon may be changed to any material.

1

The material chosen may be changed once every five seconds.2 Fini

5000Desh-Truction 420 1Y N

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item will autocast Create Glyph-Desh. (8th lvl) The User still must pay the
1600 gold when the item is invoked.

1 Fini

POINTS Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

624001 Point Spell/Ability Point Generator, 6xpd 2688 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item will generate one additional spell point OR one additional ability point,
six times per day.

1

When acquired, the bonded owner must set whether this item generates Spell points OR ability points.2 Fini

Total Value of all items: 69732 91977+22245 gold

Richard "Dick"DR2

HEALING Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

12402 Points of Healing, 1xpd 3185 2Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item provides 2 points of Healing as per the CL 1 spell, once per day.1 Fini

13700Spoon of The Fourfathers 3436 1Y Y

When used by the bonded owner, this spoon will allow the user to perform a Neutralize Posion, including Red Death
as per the TH 10 ability, once per day.

1

If the user is below level 8 then the spoon will instead allow the user to cast Neutralize Poison as per the CL 4 spell,
once per day.

2

In addition, the item will provide 10 points of Healing as per the CL 1 spell cast at level 5, once per day.3 Fini

KNOWLEDGE Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

31696Allspeak: Converse, 3xpd, innate 3596 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to cast a Converse as per the CL 5 spell, three times
per day.

1

This item is innate and cannot be sold, lost, or traded.2 Fini

MISC Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

1520Wand of Avalon, 1xpd 2909 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this wand will allow the user to cast Identify Plant/Animal as per the DR 0
spell, once per day.

1

Currently inactive - The owner can also cast Know Aura as per the MU 2 spell, once per day.2

Currently inactive - The owner can also cast Major Lore as per the KN 3 spell, once per day.3

Currently inactive - The owner can also perform a Legend Lore as per the MK 1 ability, once per day.4

Currently inactive - The owner can also cast Savvy as per the MU 1 spell, once per day.5 Fini
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11500LI Enhance +2, 1xpd 3214 1Y Y

When invoked by the bonded owner, this item allows the user to cast LI Enhance +2 as per the MU 6 spell, once
per day.

1 Fini

OFFENSIVE Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

3600+2 Magic Sword 2933 1Y Y

When wielded by the bonded owner, this is a +2 magic sword.1 Fini

Total Value of all items: 11496 23135+11639 gold

Joe BlacksmithTE50

COMPONENTS Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

1Uranium 642 1N

Uranium1 Fini

SCRAP Value Per Day Magic? Permanent?Item ID Count

1Scrap, Grade 1 641 4N

Scrap, Grade 11 Fini

Total Value of all items: $00
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